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Imperial County 
structures  pilot virtual 

direct education  delivery 
of My AmazingBody  

successfully at De Anza  
Elementary School

March

2020

Kings County partnered 
with  Master Gardeners 

to construct  garden 
beds at Lee Richmond  

school garden.

April

2020

CalFresh Healthy 
Living,  UC engages 

with Native  American 
communities in  

Riverside, El Dorado
and  Trinity Counties.

May

2020

Shasta County Cluster  
keeps physical activity
and  garden-enhanced 
learning  on everyone’s 
mind during  shelter in 
place through  summer

programs

June

2020

Santa Clara, San Mateo 
and  San Francisco 

Counties offer  distance 
training to teachers  and 
staff in support of Bay  
Area summer schools

July

2020

San Luis Obispo and
Santa  Barbara County 
Educators  continued to 
work with 5th  and 6th 
grade youth  leaders 

virtually at two  school 
sites after school  

closures.

August

2020
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Butte Cluster staff and
students  kicked off the 
new school  year with 

movement and  hygiene
classes.

September

2020

The Riverside team 
builds 700 Alvord Unified 
School District teachers 
capacity to deliver virtual 
physical activity breaks 

to reach 18,000 
students.

October

2020

48 students from 2 
Kindergarten and 1 TK 

class at Rock Creek 
Elementary School have 

been taught virtual lessons 
from 

Farm to Fork.

November

2020

The UCCE Kings & Tulare 
team has reached 1,082 
youth and over 70 adults 

with direct education 
providing support to at 

least 12 qualifying school 
sites.

December

2020

CFHL, UCCE Yolo County 
Educators provided virtual 
nutrition education lessons 
to over 75 students utilizing 

University of California 
approved curricula.

January

2021

CFHL, UCCE 
Stanislaus/Merced 

Counties has a 
partnership with La Mejor

Magazine reaching 7 
Central Valley counties 

with over 25,000 copies of 
its print distribution.

February

2021
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In Contra Costa County, 
YPAR (Youth-led 

Participatory Action 
Research) student 

researchers from Dozier-
Libbey Medical High 

School meet virtually to 
explore issues in their 

school community.

CFHL, UCCE Imperial 
County is continuing the 

CFHL, UC Youth 
Engagement Initiative 

reaching 220 students with 
condensed Youth-led 
Participatory Action 

Research, and opportunities 
to create PA Videos.

CFHL, UCCE 
Placer/Nevada Counties’ 
Nutrition Educator and 

certified Zumba instructor, 
Carrie Yarwood, created a 
Zumba PA break video for 

the 2021 CFHL, UC 
Forum which generated 
177 views and 8 likes.

March

2021

April 

2021

May

2021

June

2021

CFHL, UCCE 
Stanislaus County LIA 
collaboration led to 20 

trained promotoras
igniting local 

participation in 
teaching children about 

gardening. 

CFHL, UCCE Shasta 
Cluster team 

celebrated the end of 
the school year by 
hosting a virtual 

“Nutrition Olympics” at 
20 schools. 

July

2021

August

2021

CFHL, UCCE San 
Mateo County partners 
with JobTrain resulting 
in 128 adult students 

increasing food 
resource management 

life skills.
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